
PROJECT:

OWNER:

Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Contract A - Site Work & Utilities
1.1 1 LS $35,050.00 $35,050.00 $31,581.99 $31,581.99 $35,050.00 $35,050.00 $21,900.00 $21,900.00
1.2 1 LS 8,200.00 8,200.00 11,500.00 11,500.00 14,630.00 14,630.00 4,900.00 4,900.00
2.1 1 LS 2,500.00 2,500.00 2,200.00 2,200.00 1,000.00 1,000.00 1,400.00 1,400.00
3.1 370 Syd 3.24 * 1,198.80 5.68 * 2,101.60 4.00 1,480.00 10.30 3,811.00
3.2 35 Ton 391.43 * 13,700.05 311.43 10,900.05 103.00 3,605.00 180.00 6,300.00
3.3 35 Ton 200.00 7,000.00 103.26 3,614.10 103.00 3,605.00 180.00 6,300.00
4.1 65 Syd 9.00 585.00 13.24 860.60 10.00 650.00 10.30 669.50
4.2 575 Sft 5.62 * 3,231.50 4.54 2,610.50 5.25 3,018.75 * 5.52 3,174.00
4.3 1 LS 62,350.00 62,350.00 58,900.04 58,900.04 63,575.00 63,575.00 14,600.00 14,600.00
5.1 1 Ea 250.00 250.00 440.00 440.00 500.00 500.00 1,100.00 1,100.00
5.2 1 Ea 1,700.00 1,700.00 2,200.00 2,200.00 1,500.00 1,500.00 1,400.00 1,400.00

Subtotal Contract A * $135,765.35 * $126,908.88 $128,613.75 $65,554.50

Contract B - Playground
6.1 1 LS $212,728.00 $212,728.00 No Bid $249,010.00 $249,010.00 No Bid
6.2 1 Ea 463.00 463.00 No Bid 1,000.00 1,000.00 No Bid

Subtotal Contract B $213,191.00 N/A $250,010.00 N/A

Contract C - Splash Pad
7 Splash Pad, Complete 1 LS $198,652.00 $198,652.00 No Bid $158,685.00 4$158,685.00 No Bid

2 F & V Const. Mgmt., Inc.
Grand Rapids, MI

City Park Improvements
City of Wayland

Qty. Unit

1 Penchura, LLC
Brighton, MI

Apex Contractors, Inc.
Dorr, MI

Katerberg VerHage, Inc.
Grand Rapids, MI

Interior Piping and Valves
Site Electrical
Pavt, Rem
HMA, 13A

No. Description

BID OPENING:  January 12, 2016

Tree Rem, 19 inch to 36 inch

Playground, Complete
MDNR Required Program Acknowledgement Sign

HMA, 36A
Sidewalk, Rem
Sidewalk, Conc, 4 inch
Combined Basketball and Tennis Court, Complete
Tree Rem, 6 inch to 19 inch

Site Piping and Valves
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Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

2 F & V Const. Mgmt., Inc.
Grand Rapids, MI

Qty. Unit

1 Penchura, LLC
Brighton, MI

Apex Contractors, Inc.
Dorr, MI

Katerberg VerHage, Inc.
Grand Rapids, MI

No. Description
7A Splash Pad, Complete with Colored Concrete 1 LS $193,904.00 $193,904.00 3$185,000.00 $185,000.00 $188,570.00 4$188,570.00 No Bid

*Mathematical error
1Penchura offered a $21,000 deduction if awarded all 3 contracts
2F & V Construction Management requested to withdraw their bid.
3Apex bid Vortex equipment as a voluntary alternate
4Katerberg VerhHage requested to withdraw their bid for Contract C

Other Bidders

Contract A - Site Work & Utilities No Bid

Contract B - Playground
6.1 1 LS $214,500.00 $214,500.00
6.2 1 Ea 500.00 500.00

Subtotal Contract B $215,000.00

Contract C - Splash Pad No Bid

SUMMARY

Contract Individual Contractors Amount Individual Contractors Amount
Contract A - Site Work & Utilities Apex Contractors $126,908.88 Apex Contractors $126,908.88 $135,765.35
Contract B - Playground Penchura, LLC 213,191.00 Penchura, LLC 213,191.00 213,191.00
Contract C - Splash Pad Penchura, LLC 198,652.00 Penchura, LLC 193,904.00 193,904.00
Deduct for all 3 contracts 0.00 0.00 -21,000.00

TOTAL AMOUNT $538,751.88 $534,003.88 $521,860.35

Penchura, LLC
With Poured-in-Place Splash Pad Surface

Playground, Complete
MDNR Required Program Acknowledgement Sign

With Colored Concrete Splash Pad Surface

Sinclair Recreation
Holland, MI
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